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Netflix has come a long way since 1997, when two Silicon Valley entrepreneurs, Marc Randolph and Reed
Hastings, decided to start an online DVD store before most people owned a DVD player. They were
surprised and elated when launch-day traffic in April 1998 crashed their server and resulted in 150 sales.
Today, Netflix has more than 25 million subscribers and annual revenues above $3 billion. Yet long- term
success-or even survival-is still far from guaranteed. Journalist Gina Keating recounts the absorbing, fast-
paced drama of the company's turbulent rise to the top and its attempt to invent two new kinds of business.
First it engaged in a grueling war against video-store behemoth Blockbuster, transforming movie rental
forever. Then it jumped into an even bigger battle for online video streaming against Google, Hulu, Amazon,
and the big cable companies. Netflix ushered in such innovations as DVD rental by mail, a patented online
queue of upcoming rentals, and a recommendation algorithm called Cinematch that proved crucial in its
struggle against bigger rivals. Yet for all its success, Netflix is still a polarizing company. Hastings is often
heralded as a visionary-he was named Business Person of the Year in 2010 by Fortune-even as he has been
called the nation's worst CEO. Netflix also faces disgruntled customers after price increases and other
stumbles that could tarnish the brand forever. The quest to become the world's portal for premium video on
demand will determine nothing less than the future of entertainment and the Internet. Drawing on extensive
new interviews and her years covering Netflix as a financial and entertainment reporter, Keating makes this
tale as absorbing as it is important.
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From reader reviews:

Joel Jones:

The ability that you get from Netflixed: The Epic Battle for America's Eyeballs will be the more deep you
excavating the information that hide inside words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean
that this book is hard to understand but Netflixed: The Epic Battle for America's Eyeballs giving you thrill
feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood through
anyone who read it because the author of this guide is well-known enough. That book also makes your
personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed
or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this kind of Netflixed: The Epic Battle for America's
Eyeballs instantly.

Gerald Wright:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
any time those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously
which one would work to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you get it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen within you if you take Netflixed: The Epic Battle for America's Eyeballs as your
daily resource information.

Mandy Jackson:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, small story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not hoping Netflixed: The Epic Battle for
America's Eyeballs that give your fun preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading habit
all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world considerably better then how they react
toward the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading habit only for the geeky particular person but
for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for every you who want to start studying as your
good habit, you can pick Netflixed: The Epic Battle for America's Eyeballs become your current starter.

Matthew Haley:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a guide. They are directly felt that when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book Netflixed: The Epic Battle for
America's Eyeballs to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading expertise
is developing when you like reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the
idea about book and reading through especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book
and go through it. Beside that the e-book Netflixed: The Epic Battle for America's Eyeballs can to be your
new friend when you're feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of this time.
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