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PURPOSE/NEED FOR THIS PUBLICATION

The early Christians said to the Jews, "You have no right to live among us as Jews," and sought to make
them Christians. Then, political Christendom said, "You have no right to live among us," and created the
ghettos of physical separation. Finally, the Nazis said, "You have no right to live," and the world remained
silent.

Anti-Semitism, past and present, is a natural concomitant of the Gospel libel, which was causal and manifest
in the Holocaust. As anti-Semitism is again on the rise, and, as ignorance is not only prevalent, but also
rampant, inculcating the uneducated and misinformed masses with the truth may possibly and hopefully
result in a diminution, if not a culmination of anti-Jewish hostility.

This treatise is a depiction of the most important trial in the annals of history - a trial dealing with the most
tragic libel in the history of the human race - a libel that was causal in crusades, inquisitions, pogroms,
Holocausts, and other crimes against an innocent people for more than nineteen centuries. Rectifying this
ongoing injustice is the primary purpose of this publication!

A CHALLENGE

For more than nineteen centuries, Christians have been accusing Jews of having shed innocent blood, the
blood of their lord Jesus Christ. They claim that almost two thousand years ago, the Great Sanhedrin, the
highest tribunal in the land of Judea, unjustly convicted Jesus of the capital offense of blasphemy, and
delivered him to the Roman Procurator to be crucified.

This accusation based solely upon the testimony of the Four Gospels, has never been brought to trial in any
court of law. No verdict and no decision of guilt against the Jews has ever been handed down by a competent
tribunal. Yet, Christians have ever since been depriving the Jews of their legal and natural rights without due
process of law.

The Jews cannot forever stand accused of this heinous crime by a unilateral opinion and suffer untold
misery. They are entitled, at long last, to have their day in court and to refute this long-standing accusation. It
is for this reason this case is being brought to the attention of the world.
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From reader reviews:

Joann Hamilton:

This book untitled The Gospel Libel (Volume I) to be one of several books which best seller in this year,
honestly, that is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy
that book in the book retail store or you can order it via online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book
too. It makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So
there is no reason to your account to past this e-book from your list.

Darlene Johnson:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book particularly book
entitled The Gospel Libel (Volume I) your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every
aspect that maybe unknown for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a e-
book then become one type conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get before. The The
Gospel Libel (Volume I) giving you a different experience more than blown away your brain but also giving
you useful information for your better life within this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern here is
your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a sport. Do you
want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Jacquelin Vasquez:

The book untitled The Gospel Libel (Volume I) contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains
the woman idea with easy means. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do certainly not worry,
you can easy to read that. The book was compiled by famous author. The author brings you in the new
period of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or gadget,
so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their
official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice learn.

Leonard Jones:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but additionally novel and The Gospel Libel (Volume I) or perhaps others
sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel desire to read more
and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those guides are helping
them to include their knowledge. In some other case, beside science publication, any other book likes The
Gospel Libel (Volume I) to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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