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While the relationship between gender and fascism has been fully explored in studies of Nazi Germany and
Fascist Italy, attitudes toward women in the reactionary politics of post-revolutionary France have received
little scholarly attention. This collection looks at right-wing ideology and its relation to gender in a variety of
historical and cultural contexts, including women's writing, children's stories, film, books, magazines, and
propaganda pieces. The volume addresses the question of whether fascism's stereotype as "a pathologically
masculine" ideology is indeed true. Essays explore topics like women and anti-Semitism during the Dreyfus
affair, Genet and the fantasy of homo-fascism, gendered eugenics, and female icons during the Vichy period.
Locating the intersection of gender and the right, the editors explain, significantly alters traditional
perspectives on French culture in this century, thereby bringing to light not only new objects of study but
challenging a priori assumptions about France's cultural politics.
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From reader reviews:

Arnold Grigg:

Throughout other case, little men and women like to read book Gender and Fascism in Modern France
(Contemporary French Culture and Society). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book.
Provided that we know about how is important some sort of book Gender and Fascism in Modern France
(Contemporary French Culture and Society). You can add understanding and of course you can around the
world with a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can know everything! From your country until
foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you can know that. In
this era, we are able to open a book as well as searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You can
utilize it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's study.

Laura Hargis:

Now a day people who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more
to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Examining
a book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specially this Gender and Fascism in Modern
France (Contemporary French Culture and Society) book because this book offers you rich information and
knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you
probably know this.

Myrtle Brown:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you examine a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, because book has
a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you have read.
In order to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you want to entertain
yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and also soon. The Gender and Fascism in Modern
France (Contemporary French Culture and Society) provide you with new experience in reading through a
book.

Noah Gardner:

Beside this kind of Gender and Fascism in Modern France (Contemporary French Culture and Society) in
your phone, it may give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the
knowledge you will got here is fresh through the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an older
people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Gender and Fascism in Modern France
(Contemporary French Culture and Society) because this book offers to your account readable information.
Do you often have book but you do not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you
have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring



beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book along with read it from now!
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