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In Nursing Civil Rights, Charissa J. Threat investigates the parallel battles against occupational segregation
by African American women and white men in the U.S. Army.

As Threat reveals, both groups viewed their circumstances with the Army Nurse Corps as a civil rights
matter. Each conducted separate integration campaigns to end the discrimination they suffered. Yet their
stories defy the narrative that civil rights struggles inevitably arced toward social justice. Threat tells how
progressive elements in the campaigns did indeed break down barriers in both military and civilian nursing.
At the same time, she follows conservative threads to portray how some of the women who succeeded as
agents of change became defenders of exclusionary practices when men sought military nursing careers. The
ironic result was a struggle that simultaneously confronted and reaffirmed the social hierarchies that nurtured
discrimination.
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From reader reviews:

Luther Brown:

The book Nursing Civil Rights: Gender and Race in the Army Nurse Corps (Women, Gender, and Sexuality
in American History) has a lot details on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of
profit. The book was published by the very famous author. Tom makes some research ahead of write this
book. This specific book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this article book.

Johnnie Santiago:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get great deal of
stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely sure.
People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity are there when the
spare time coming to anyone of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, often the book you have read will
be Nursing Civil Rights: Gender and Race in the Army Nurse Corps (Women, Gender, and Sexuality in
American History).

Nicol Thomas:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Nursing Civil Rights: Gender and
Race in the Army Nurse Corps (Women, Gender, and Sexuality in American History) publication written by
well-known writer who knows well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who else read the
book. Written throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate
your hunger then you still doubt Nursing Civil Rights: Gender and Race in the Army Nurse Corps (Women,
Gender, and Sexuality in American History) as good book not only by the cover but also by the content. This
is one guide that can break don't determine book by its cover, so do you still needing another sixth sense to
pick that!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to an additional
sixth sense.

Michele Fernandez:

You can spend your free time to see this book this reserve. This Nursing Civil Rights: Gender and Race in
the Army Nurse Corps (Women, Gender, and Sexuality in American History) is simple to deliver you can
read it in the playground, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not get much space to bring
typically the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save
the actual book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this
book.
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