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Although political philosophers debate the morality of open borders, few social scientists have explored what
would happen if immigration were no longer limited. This book looks at three historical examples of
temporarily unrestricted migration into the United States, France, and Ireland: the arrival of Mariel Cubans in
Miami (Florida) in 1980, the flight of Pied Noir and Harki refugees from Algeria to Marseille in 1962, and
the migration of Poles and other new European Union 'Accession 8' citizens into Dublin in 2004. Based on
personal interviews, archival research, and statistical analysis, the study finds that the effects of these
population movements on the economics, politics, and social life of these cities were much less catastrophic
than opponents of free immigration claim. Detailed chapters cover schools, crime, ethnic politics,
unemployment and wages, public finances, housing, and racial violence.
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From reader reviews:

Kristin Todd:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important issue to bring us around
the world. Adjacent to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book Open Borders and
International Migration Policy: The Effects of Unrestricted Immigration in the United States, France, and
Ireland will make you to be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about everything.
But some of you think which open or reading a book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they
could be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or suitable book with you?

Victor Banister:

As people who live in often the modest era should be revise about what going on or details even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to you
actually is you don't know which one you should start with. This Open Borders and International Migration
Policy: The Effects of Unrestricted Immigration in the United States, France, and Ireland is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in this
era.

Michael Griffin:

The knowledge that you get from Open Borders and International Migration Policy: The Effects of
Unrestricted Immigration in the United States, France, and Ireland could be the more deep you searching the
information that hide inside words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean that this book is
hard to know but Open Borders and International Migration Policy: The Effects of Unrestricted Immigration
in the United States, France, and Ireland giving you thrill feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point
in selected way that can be understood simply by anyone who read that because the author of this guide is
well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is
easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend
you for having this specific Open Borders and International Migration Policy: The Effects of Unrestricted
Immigration in the United States, France, and Ireland instantly.

Ann Craft:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get lots of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , if we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not only a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you have when the
spare time coming to you of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading
guides. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the book you have read will be Open
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