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A daring new departure from the inspired creator of The Vampire Chronicles (“unrelentingly erotic . . .
unforgettable”—The Washington Post), Lives of the Mayfair Witches (“Anne Rice will live on through the
ages of literature”—San Francisco Chronicle), and the angels of The Songs of the Seraphim
(“remarkable”—Associated Press). A whole new world—modern, sleek, high-tech—and at its center, a story
as old and compelling as history: the making of a werewolf, reimagined and reinvented as only Anne Rice,
teller of mesmerizing tales, conjurer extraordinaire of other realms, could create.
 
The time is the present.
 
The place, the rugged coast of Northern California. A bluff high above the Pacific. A grand mansion full of
beauty and tantalizing history set against a towering redwood forest.
 
A young reporter on assignment from the San Francisco Observer . . . An older woman welcoming him into
her magnificent family home that he has been sent to write about and that she must sell with some urgency . .
. A chance encounter between two unlikely people . . . An idyllic night—shattered by horrific unimaginable
violence, the young man inexplicably attacked—bitten—by a beast he cannot see in the rural darkness . . . A
violent episode that sets in motion a terrifying yet seductive transformation, as the young man, caught
between ecstasy and horror, between embracing who he is evolving into and fearing what he will become,
soon experiences the thrill of the wolf gift.
 
As he resists the paradoxical pleasure and enthrallment of his wolfen savagery and delights in the power and
(surprising) capacity for good, he is caught up in a strange and dangerous rescue and is desperately hunted as
“the Man Wolf” by authorities, the media, and scientists (evidence of DNA threatens to reveal his dual
existence) . . . As a new and profound love enfolds him, questions emerge that propel him deeper into his
mysterious new world: questions of why and how he has been given this gift; of its true nature and the
curious but satisfying pull towards goodness; of the profound realization that there may be others like him
who are watching—guardian creatures who have existed throughout time who possess ancient secrets and
alchemical knowledge. And throughout it all, the search for salvation for a soul tormented by a new realm of
temptations, and the fraught, exhilarating journey, still to come, of being and becoming, fully, both wolf and
man.

This edition features an excerpt from Anne Rice's latest novel The Wolves of Mid-Winter.
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From reader reviews:

Sarah Fernandez:

With other case, little persons like to read book The Wolf Gift: The Wolf Gift Chronicles (1). You can
choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. As long as we know about how is important any book
The Wolf Gift: The Wolf Gift Chronicles (1). You can add knowledge and of course you can around the
world by way of a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can recognize everything! From your
country until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you can know
that. In this era, we can easily open a book or even searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You need
to use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's go through.

Eddie Horton:

Often the book The Wolf Gift: The Wolf Gift Chronicles (1) has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to
read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The author
makes some research before write this book. That book very easy to read you will get the point easily after
reading this article book.

Jennifer Nava:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specially book entitled The
Wolf Gift: The Wolf Gift Chronicles (1) your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
each and every aspect that maybe not known for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging each and
every word written in a guide then become one type conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get
prior to. The The Wolf Gift: The Wolf Gift Chronicles (1) giving you yet another experience more than
blown away your head but also giving you useful data for your better life on this era. So now let us teach you
the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished studying it, like
winning an activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Matthew Russell:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information quicker to share.
You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can observe
that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that recommended for you is The
Wolf Gift: The Wolf Gift Chronicles (1) this reserve consist a lot of the information with the condition of
this world now. This book was represented how can the world has grown up. The terminology styles that
writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he makes
this book. This is why this book suitable all of you.
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