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A Great and Good Man presents a lively collection of contemporary letters, poems, addresses, and
newspaper reports that demonstrate the remarkable esteem in which Washington was held. Washington
would become, after his death, a true symbol of the American republic. This selection of materials, many
reprinted for the first time since the eighteenth century, shows that in his life Washington had already
become the Father of his country and was acclaimed for his sense of honor, his heroism, and his wisdom.

Dating from his farewell orders to the Continental Army in 1783 to his retirement from the executive office
of the United States of America, the selections in this book illuminate the role that Washington played in the
public imagination. His willing relinquishment of military authority in 1783 shocked the world, and set him
on a path toward greater political glory as he presided over the Constitutional Convention and then became
the first President of the country. Here we see Washington as he stood before and was addressed by the
nation—praised by politicians, advised by foreigners, and lionized by citizens. In Washington's own letters
and addresses we also glimpse the canny side of Washington, a man who was careful with his public image
and was a shrewd gamesman in the political arena. By the time he took presidential office in 1789 few
questioned his political acumen and national leaders were dependent on his leadership.

The editors of A Great and Good Man have set the context for their carefully selected documents with
insightful introductions; and their thorough index greatly enhances the accessibility of the material presented.
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From reader reviews:

Joyce Shryock:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or even goal; it means that publication
has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time to read a book. These are reading
whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, individual feel need book if they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this A Great and Good Man: George Washington in the Eyes of His
Contemporaries.

James Holmes:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they're still students or this for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great and important the book A Great and Good Man: George
Washington in the Eyes of His Contemporaries. All type of book can you see on many methods. You can
look for the internet sources or other social media.

Michael Marx:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know what one you should start with. This A Great and Good Man: George
Washington in the Eyes of His Contemporaries is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world.
Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Michael Robinson:

The feeling that you get from A Great and Good Man: George Washington in the Eyes of His
Contemporaries is the more deep you rooting the information that hide in the words the more you get
thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but A Great and Good Man:
George Washington in the Eyes of His Contemporaries giving you joy feeling of reading. The author
conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by simply anyone who read it because the author
of this guide is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. It
is therefore easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise
you for having this particular A Great and Good Man: George Washington in the Eyes of His
Contemporaries instantly.
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