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The Episcopal Church was the first in the American colonies to baptize blacks, to ordain a black minister,
and to establish an African American congregation. Yet membership by blacks in the Episcopal Church has
always been viewed as an anomaly. In a nation in which 80 percent of the black Christian population belong
to black denominations, it has seemed incongruous to many that the descendants of slaves and the
descendants of slaveholders could together find a spiritual home in the Episcopal Church. Moreover, the
mode of religious expression of Anglicanism has been seen as incompatible with the black religious
ethos.Attempts to explain this phenomenon frequently dismiss black Episcopalians as social climbers, and
their authenticity as African Americans, and even as Christians, is called into question. Yet With a Steady
Best, however, argues that blacks have remained in the Episcopal Church because they have recognized it as
catholic and therefore inclusive institution. For two hundred years blacks have challenged the church to be
true to its catholic claims and have used this principle as a basis for their demands for recognition. This book
chronicles the “steady beat” of that challenge.Harold T. Lewis, former staff officer for Black Ministries at
the Episcopal Church Center in New York, is a parish priest in the Diocese of Long Island, Professor of
Homiletics at the George Mercer School of Theology, and Adjunct Professor of Preaching at New York
Theological Seminary.
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From reader reviews:

Nellie Ferguson:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be update about what going on or info even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era which can be always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This Yet With A Steady Beat: The
African American Struggle for Recognition in the Episcopal Church is our recommendation to make you
keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Kenneth Harrell:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of e-
book you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education books but if you want really feel
happy read one having theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the Yet With A Steady
Beat: The African American Struggle for Recognition in the Episcopal Church is kind of reserve which is
giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Linda Cooper:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do
you possess when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer can unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, often
the book you have read is usually Yet With A Steady Beat: The African American Struggle for Recognition
in the Episcopal Church.

Nancy Stever:

This Yet With A Steady Beat: The African American Struggle for Recognition in the Episcopal Church is
new way for you who has fascination to look for some information given it relief your hunger of knowledge.
Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having small amount
of digest in reading this Yet With A Steady Beat: The African American Struggle for Recognition in the
Episcopal Church can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside that book is easy to
get through anyone. These books create itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the
e-book form. People who think that in guide form make them feel tired even dizzy this reserve is the answer.
So you cannot find any in reading a publication especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It
should be here for an individual. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book kind for your better life as well as



knowledge.
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