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A colorful memoir of Jewish life in China during the first half of the twentieth century.

Dolly Beil spent the first part of her life in the Chinese cities of Tsingtao (Qingdao), Mukden (Shenyang),
Harbin, and Tientsin (Tianjin). Her father, owner of a jewellery store and a businessman, descended from the
prominent family of Solomon Guterman, who owned an estate in Irkutsk, Russia. Her mother was one of
three daughters of Grigory Lazarovich Gershevich, who built the first hotel in the northern city of Harbin,
located on Pacific Road.

The year of Dolly's birth -- 1927 -- meant that she and her family, part of the country's small Jewish
community, would live through events that would change China, and them, forever:

The Japanese occupation●

Liberation by Americans at the end of World War II●

Civil war between Nationalist and Communist forces●

The flight of foreign nationals from an increasingly closed society●

Beil's entertaining stories will draw you into an unusual blend of European and Asian life in the country of
her early joys and sorrows: China, the country that she loves so much to this very day.

Includes seventy black and white photos.
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From reader reviews:

Roxanne Harrelson:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the book entitled Growing Up Jewish in China. Try to stumble through book
Growing Up Jewish in China as your buddy. It means that it can to be your friend when you sense alone and
beside associated with course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book
makes you considerably more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let us make
new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Jennifer Newhouse:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book eligible Growing Up Jewish
in China? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time with
your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have additional
opinion?

Robert Araiza:

Exactly why? Because this Growing Up Jewish in China is an unordinary book that the inside of the book
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will surprise you with the secret that inside. Reading this book beside it
was fantastic author who else write the book in such awesome way makes the content inside of easier to
understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of rewards
than the other book have such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking technique. So , still
want to hold up having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

James Crist:

A lot of people said that they feel weary when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose typically the book Growing Up Jewish in China to make your
reading is interesting. Your skill of reading expertise is developing when you like reading. Try to choose
easy book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the opinion about book and reading through
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open a book and go through it. Beside that the e-
book Growing Up Jewish in China can to be your friend when you're really feel alone and confuse with the
information must you're doing of the time.
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