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Killing Time is a collection of largely humorous critical commentary and discussion on everything from
politics to insanity and religion. The segments, taken from the author's daily journal covering the period late
2012 to early 2014, were intended to 'kill some time' while resting from the demands of completing a
complex work of psychology and neurology that is The Insanity Myth (near ready for publication).
Autobiographical in style, Killing Time is a work of 'creative non-fiction,' rife with humour, satire and
personal unloading. It is also perhaps less brave than simply 'world-weary' in offering a sincere challenge to
some of the most respected thinkers/writers on science and subjective thought (the author is of senior years).
In this, Killing Time 'takes no prisoners'--playfully and otherwise, it cuts, thrusts and taunts even 'tall
poppies.' Widely, it teases, lampoons, elevates, and deprecates humanity itself; its authority is based on
scholarship, inner and outer adventure, experience and age. Covertly and openly, it offers the reader an
uncommon and refreshing perspective on subjective discourses and language terms; it claims no 'belief' and
avoids the usual hackneyed polarization in contentious issues discussed. In doing so, it arises spontaneously
from what was of significance and interest to the author day-by-day. It is a book about how humans are
spending time in the greater world of time itself--and occasionally 'killing time' with the therapy of comic
relief.

Killing Time is like a holiday jaunt through the author's interests, attitudes, moods, abilities, life-style, global
locality, commitments and sense of fate; it is a fluent spill of prose that occasionally uses a bit of doggerel or
a vignette to condense and deliver its message.

Foremost, Killing Time is a book for Australian readers, largely because of the political and social content.
Though written with no 'target audience' in mind, the book's humour, pathos, and satire will find readers
amongst writers, journalists, and astute readers/observers, in any country.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Berg:

Book is definitely written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A reserve Killing Time: from a writer's
journal: commentary on the human condition` will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel a lot
more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think this open or reading any book
make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you searching for
best book or suitable book with you?

Nick Jansen:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of
you maybe can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know which one you should start with. This Killing Time: from a writer's
journal: commentary on the human condition` is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Jennifer Vickery:

This Killing Time: from a writer's journal: commentary on the human condition` is brand-new way for you
who has intense curiosity to look for some information because it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you
into it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having small amount of digest in reading
this Killing Time: from a writer's journal: commentary on the human condition` can be the light food to suit
your needs because the information inside this specific book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books
create itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book contact form. People who
think that in reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So you cannot find any in
reading a reserve especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person.
So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and also knowledge.

Lee Parkin:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that query
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person similar to reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to
understand that reading is very important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add
you knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update about
something by book. Numerous books that can you take to be your object. One of them is actually Killing
Time: from a writer's journal: commentary on the human condition`.
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