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A book lover today might sometimes feel like the fictional medieval friar William of Baskerville in Eco’s
The Name of the Rose, watching the written word become lost to time. In This Is Not the End of the Book,
that book’s author, Umberto Eco, and his fellow raconteur Jean-Claude Carriere sit down for a dazzling
dialogue about memory and the pitfalls, blanks, omissions, and irredeemable losses of which it is made. Both
men collect rare and precious books, and they joyously hold up books as hardy survivors, engaging in a
critical, impassioned, and rollicking journey through book history, from papyrus scrolls to the e-book. Along
the way, they touch upon science and subjectivity, dialectics and anecdotes, and they wear their immense
learning lightly. A smiling tribute to what Marshall McLuhan called the Gutenberg Galaxy, this dialogue will
be a delight for all readers and book lovers.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Bradford:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled This Is Not the End of the Book. Try to stumble through book
This Is Not the End of the Book as your good friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you feel
alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself.
The book makes you much more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , we should
make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Emanuel Douglas:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book This Is Not the End of the Book. You can choose the
best book if you love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a book This Is Not the End
of the Book. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right,
since from book you can understand everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will
end up known. About simple point until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, you can open a book
or maybe searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored to go to the
library. Let's examine.

Elizabeth Sherer:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book and so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a publication you will get new information since book is one of numerous ways
to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially fiction book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read this This Is
Not the End of the Book, it is possible to tells your family, friends and soon about yours e-book. Your
knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a book.

Tania Hansen:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we know those
guides have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. By
book This Is Not the End of the Book we can have more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people?
For being creative person must choose to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that suitable with
your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with this book This Is Not the End of the Book. You can
more appealing than now.
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