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This study considers the historical, cultural, and literary significance of some of the most important Ancient
Near East (ANE) texts that illuminate the Hebrew Bible. Christopher B. Hays provides primary texts from
the Ancient Near East with a comparison to literature of the Hebrew Bible to demonstrate how Israel's
Scriptures not only draw from these ancient contexts but also reshape them in a unique way.

Hays offers a brief introduction to comparative studies, then lays out examples from various literary genres
that shed light on particular biblical texts. Texts about ANE law collections, treaties, theological histories,
prophecies, ritual texts, oracles, prayers, hymns, laments, edicts, and instructions are compared to
corresponding literature in the Pentateuch, Prophets, and Writings of the Hebrew Bible. The book includes
summaries to help instructors and students identify key points for comparison. By considering the literary
and historical context of other literature, students will come away with a better understanding of the
historical, literary, and theological depth of the Hebrew Bible.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Burdette:

What do you regarding book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you need something
to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy person? If you don't
have spare time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time? What did
you do? Everyone has many questions above. They have to answer that question due to the fact just their can
do that will. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is suitable. Because start
from on kindergarten until university need this specific Hidden Riches: A Sourcebook for the Comparative
Study of the Hebrew Bible and Ancient Near East to read.

Stacey Ryan:

This Hidden Riches: A Sourcebook for the Comparative Study of the Hebrew Bible and Ancient Near East
are usually reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The main reason of this
Hidden Riches: A Sourcebook for the Comparative Study of the Hebrew Bible and Ancient Near East can be
among the great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed
anyone with information that might be will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is handy, you can
bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed ones. Beside that this
Hidden Riches: A Sourcebook for the Comparative Study of the Hebrew Bible and Ancient Near East giving
you an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we
realize it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Vera Harris:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to examine a book. When you
study a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to
the fact book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you act
like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, as well as soon. The
Hidden Riches: A Sourcebook for the Comparative Study of the Hebrew Bible and Ancient Near East
provide you with new experience in examining a book.

Sheila Whitley:

Publication is one of source of information. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students and
also native or citizen want book to know the update information of year in order to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world.
From the book Hidden Riches: A Sourcebook for the Comparative Study of the Hebrew Bible and Ancient
Near East we can have more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To get creative person must
choose to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't always be



doubt to change your life at this book Hidden Riches: A Sourcebook for the Comparative Study of the
Hebrew Bible and Ancient Near East. You can more pleasing than now.
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