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Growing interest in the field of mental health in the workplace among policy makers, clinicians, and
researchers alike has been fueled by equal employment rights legislation and increasing disability statistics in
mental heath. The importance of addressing this topic is underscored by the fact that depression now ranks
second on the hierarchy of occupational disabilities. The problem is compounded by a host of factors,
including major difficulties in job retention and productivity experienced by persons with mental health
disabilities; younger age and higher education of persons with mental health problems; and labor shortages
and an aging workforce in many industrialized countries. In addition, particularly in the United States, the
vocational needs of army veterans returning from duty with mental health disorders require system-based
solutions and new rehabilitation approaches.

The pressure created by these powerful legislative, societal, and economic forces has not been matched by
the state of evidence-based practices in the field of employment retention and job accommodation in mental
health. Current research evidence is fragmented, limited in scope, difficult to access, and adversely affected
by the traditional divide between the fields of psychiatry and psychology on one hand and interdisciplinary
employment research and practices on the other. As a result, policy makers, employers, disability
compensation systems, and rehabilitation and disability management professionals have been left without a
critical "how to" evidence-informed toolbox for occupational practices to accommodate and retain persons
with mental health disabilities in the workplace. Currently, no single source of knowledge and research
evidence exists in the field that would guide best practices. Yet the need for workplace accommodations for
persons with mental health disabilities has been growing and, based on epidemiological trends, is anticipated
to grow even more in the future. These trends leave physicians, psychologists, occupational therapists,
vocational rehabilitation professionals, disability managers, human resource professionals, and policy makers
poorly prepared to face the challenge of integrating and maintaining persons with mental health disabilities
in the workplace.

The aim of the Handbook is to close the gap between the needs of the professionals and networks that work
with or study persons with mental heath disorders in an employment context and the actual knowledge base
in the field. The Handbook will be written in language that can easily be understood by readers representing
a multitude of disciplines and research paradigms spanning the mental health, rehabilitation, and
employment fields of inquiry. The Handbook will contribute an integration of the best quantitative and
qualitative research in the field, together with experts’ consensus, regarding effective work retention and
accommodation strategies and practices in mental health. The book will consist of five major sections,
divided into chapters written by recognized experts in these areas.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Longoria:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or even goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They may be reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby will be reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, man feel need book once they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well,
probably you should have this Work Accommodation and Retention in Mental Health.

Karl Schueller:

The feeling that you get from Work Accommodation and Retention in Mental Health is the more deep you
digging the information that hide inside words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to understand but Work Accommodation and Retention in Mental Health giving
you enjoyment feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in particular way that can be
understood through anyone who read the item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This
specific book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can
go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having that Work
Accommodation and Retention in Mental Health instantly.

Robert Banks:

As a student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as well
as to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's spirit
or real their leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to
generally there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and can't
see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Work Accommodation and Retention in Mental Health can make you sense more
interested to read.

Jennifer Evans:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that question was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And also you know
that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them are these claims Work
Accommodation and Retention in Mental Health.
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