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Even in the twenty-first century the popular image of a scientist is a reclusive genius in a lab coat, mixing
formulas or working out equations inaccessible to all but the initiated few. The idea that scientists are
somehow smarter than the rest of us is a common, yet dangerous, misconception, getting us off the hook for
not knowing—or caring—how the world works. How did science become so divorced from our everyday
experience? Is scientific understanding so far out of reach for the non-scientists among us?

As science popularizer Chad Orzel argues in Eureka, even the people who are most forthright about hating
science are doing science, often without even knowing it. Orzel shows that science isn’t something alien and
inscrutable beyond the capabilities of ordinary people, it’s central to the human experience. Every human can
think like a scientist, and regularly does so in the course of everyday activities. The disconnect between this
reality and most people’s perception is mostly due to the common misconception that science is a body of
(boring, abstract, often mathematical) facts. In truth, science is best thought of as a process: Looking at the
world, Thinking about what makes it work, Testing your mental model by comparing it to reality, and
Telling others about your results. The facts that we too often think of as the whole of science are merely the
product of this scientific process. Eureka shows that this process is one we all regularly use, and something
that everybody can do.

By revealing the connection between the everyday activities that people do—solving crossword puzzles,
playing sports, or even watching mystery shows on television—and the processes used to make great
scientific discoveries, Orzel shows that if we recognize the process of doing science as something familiar,
we will be better able to appreciate scientific discoveries, and use scientific facts and thinking to help address
the problems that affect us all.
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From reader reviews:

Carson McDonald:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or info even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of
you maybe can update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know which you should start with. This Eureka: Discovering
Your Inner Scientist is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because this book
serves what you want and wish in this era.

Celina Ziolkowski:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or
picnic within the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to
fill your free time/ holiday? May be reading a book may be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The first
thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to try look for book, may
be the e-book untitled Eureka: Discovering Your Inner Scientist can be excellent book to read. May be it
may be best activity to you.

Pam Gray:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you study a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Eureka: Discovering Your Inner Scientist provide you with new experience in reading
through a book.

Bridgett Killion:

Beside this Eureka: Discovering Your Inner Scientist in your phone, it could give you a way to get nearer to
the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh from your
oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow community. It is good thing
to have Eureka: Discovering Your Inner Scientist because this book offers for your requirements readable
information. Do you occasionally have book but you would not get what it's about. Oh come on, that won't
happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, such as
treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss that? Find this book in addition to read it from right
now!
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