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Ask anyone who has owned a pet and they’ll assure you that, yes, animals have personalities. And science is
beginning to agree. Researchers have demonstrated that both domesticated and nondomesticated
animals—from invertebrates to monkeys and apes—behave in consistently different ways, meeting the
criteria for what many define as personality. But why the differences, and how are personalities shaped by
genes and environment? How did they evolve? The essays in Animal Personalities reveal that there is much
to learn from our furred and feathered friends.

           

The study of animal personality is one of the fastest-growing areas of research in behavioral and
evolutionary biology. Here Claudio Carere and Dario Maestripieri, along with a host of scholars from fields
as diverse as ecology, genetics, endocrinology, neuroscience, and psychology, provide a comprehensive
overview of the current research on animal personality. Grouped into thematic sections, chapters approach
the topic with empirical and theoretical material and show that to fully understand why personality exists, we
must consider the evolutionary processes that give rise to personality, the ecological correlates of personality
differences, and the physiological mechanisms underlying personality variation.
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From reader reviews:

Lela Koehn:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book Animal Personalities: Behavior, Physiology, and Evolution.
You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a new
book Animal Personalities: Behavior, Physiology, and Evolution. You can add information and of course
you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can realize everything! From
your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple issue until wonderful
thing you are able to know that. In this era, you can open a book or perhaps searching by internet unit. It is
called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Justin Fernandez:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a guide you will get new information since book is one of many ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make you more imaginative. When you
reading through a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the
people do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this Animal
Personalities: Behavior, Physiology, and Evolution, you may tells your family, friends and soon about yours
e-book. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a e-book.

Sarah Petty:

The reserve untitled Animal Personalities: Behavior, Physiology, and Evolution is the reserve that
recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to a person.
The language that publisher use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
article author was did a lot of investigation when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to
you personally is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Animal Personalities: Behavior,
Physiology, and Evolution from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Keith Lugo:

In this particular era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time very little but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many
books in the top listing in your reading list is Animal Personalities: Behavior, Physiology, and Evolution.
This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning into precious person. By
looking up and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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