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Are you a creative professional? Do you spend too much time doing repetitive production tasks such as
placing and replacing images, resizing them, dragging them from one document to another, and preparing
images for printing instead of being creative? Do you use Adobe Illustrator CS2 and have some experience
with scripting? Then this book is for you. Virtually every repetitive or time-consuming task that creative
professionals have to do in the Adobe Creative Suite can be streamlined with the help of a script. This book
describes how to use JavaScript to manipulate and extend Adobe Illustrator within Adobe Creative Suite 2,
and provides reference information for the JavaScript objects, properties, and functions defined by Adobe's
applications. Available in print for the first time, this scripting reference provides the information
experienced JavaScript user needs to create custom scripts for the Illustrator, whether you're looking to
capture and automate parts of the printing process; manipulate swatches to create new patterns, gradients and
spot colors; or create a script that applies formatting to selected text or changes a selected path's shape. These
are just a few examples of how you can use Illustrator CS2's built-in scripting capabilities to save you from
hours of repetitive tasks.
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From reader reviews:

Jerry Brock:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
by simply surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is
high. In your case who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you that Adobe Illustrator CS2
Official JavaScript Reference book as beginning and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more
than just a book.

Patricia Gallagher:

The particular book Adobe Illustrator CS2 Official JavaScript Reference will bring someone to the new
experience of reading the book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. Should you try to find
new book to learn, this book very suitable to you. The book Adobe Illustrator CS2 Official JavaScript
Reference is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you
can easier to read the book.

Angelica Adams:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you read a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, mainly because
book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that
you have read. In order to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you want
to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, along with soon. The Adobe
Illustrator CS2 Official JavaScript Reference will give you new experience in reading through a book.

William Sinclair:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading.
Some people likes looking at, not only science book but novel and Adobe Illustrator CS2 Official JavaScript
Reference or perhaps others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the great a
book, you feel need to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or maybe students
especially. Those ebooks are helping them to add their knowledge. In other case, beside science publication,
any other book likes Adobe Illustrator CS2 Official JavaScript Reference to make your spare time far more
colorful. Many types of book like this.
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